FEDERATION UNIVERSITY AUSTRALIA

Federation University Australia Act 2010

Federation University Australia (Miscellaneous
Amendments) Regulations 2023

In accordance with sections 53 and 54 of the Federation University Australia Statute
2021, I, Duncan Bentley, Vice-Chancellor and President of Federation University
Australia, make amendments to the following Regulations as described below:

DMWA.

Date: 25 May 2023

Amendments to the Federation University Australia (Academic)
Regulations 2022

1. Principal Regulations

In this Part, principal Regulations means the Federation University
(Academic) Regulations 2022.




Federation University Australia (Miscellaneous Amendments) Regulations 2023

2. The Academic Board and its Committees

M

)

3)

3)

“4)

In Schedule 1 to the principal Regulations (Academic Board Charter),
under the heading “Meetings”: delete the words “ten (10) members”
and replace them with the words “fifty per cent (50%) of the
membership”.

In Schedule 2 to the principal Regulations (Academic Board
Administrative Committee Charter), under the heading “Meetings”,
delete the words “five (5) members” and replace them with the words
“fifty per cent (50%) of the membership”.

In Schedule 3 to the principal Regulations (Curriculum Committee
Charter) -

(a) Under the heading “Membership”:
(i) delete the sixth dot point; and

(ii) insert the sentence “Co-opted members do not have voting
rights.”

(b) Under the heading “Meetings”: delete the words “seven (7)
members” and replace them with the words “fifty per cent
(50%) of the membership”.

In Schedule 4 to the principal Regulations (Learning and Teaching
Quality Committee Charter):

(a) Under the heading “Membership”: insert the sentence “Co-
opted members do not have voting rights.”

(b) Under the heading “Meetings”: delete the words “seven (7)
members” and replace them with the words “fifty per cent
(50%) of the membership”;

In Schedule 5 to the principal Regulations (Research Committee
Charter) under the heading “Meetings”, delete the words “five (5)
members” and replace them with the words “fifty per cent (50%) of the
membership”.




